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leading or inciting others to disrupt scheduled and/or ordinary activities 
within the University premises. 

 
Unauthorized Entry. Entry without proper permission into residential 
halls, buildings, or structures within the University premises, or the aiding 
and assisting of such unauthorized entry. 

 
Aiding or Inciting. Aiding, abetting, or procuring another person to breach 
the peace on university premises or at functions sponsored by the 
University, assisting or persuading others to commit any act of misconduct 
in the University community or environment. 

 
Alcoholic Beverages. Violation of the University Alcohol and Controlled 
Substance Policy, including but not limited to the use, consumption, 
possession, purchase, sale, and/or distribution of alcoholic beverages on 
University property, or at any of its activities (whether on or off-campus) 
are prohibited, except as expressly permitted by University regulations and 
local, state and federal law. Alcoholic beverages may not, in any 
circumstances, be used by, possessed by or distributed to any person under 
twenty-one (21) years of age. (Refer to Alcohol and Illegal Controlled 
Substances Policy.) 

 
Dangerous Drugs. Violation of the University Alcohol and Controlled 
Substance Policy, including but not limited to the use, consumption, 
possession, manufacturing, purchase, sale and/or distribution of illicit 
drugs, narcotics or other controlled dangerous substances and drug 
paraphernalia are strictly prohibited; all local, state, and federal laws apply. 
(Refer to Alcohol and Illegal Controlled Substances Policy.) 

 
Dogs, Cats and Other Animals. Bringing animals and pets onto the 
University premises is prohibited. Seeing-eye dogs, when accompanied by 
their owners, are permitted. (See EMOTIONAL SUPPORT & SERVICE ASSISTANCE 
ANIMALS(ESSA)Policy)https://www.gram.edu/student- 
life/services/counseling-center/accessibility.php) 

 
Drunkenness. Appearing in public on the University premises while 
intoxicated or under the influence of alcohol or illicit drugs is strictly 
prohibited. This includes any disorderly conduct regardless of whether such 
conduct results in injury to persons or property. 

 
False Reporting of Emergencies. These include but are not limited to 
activating a fire alarm or falsely reporting a bomb. 

 
Gambling. Illegal gambling on University premises is strictly prohibited. 

 
Information Disclosure. Failure to provide personal identification and/or 
furnishing false information to any University official, faculty/staff 
member, or office is prohibited. For example, failure to present a driver's 
license or identification card when requested by a University police officer. 

 
Indecent, Obscene, Immoral Behavior, or Profanity. This includes 
conduct which is disorderly, lewd, or indecent. Such acts include but are not 
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